
 
 
 
About FedEx Corporation: 

FedEx Corp. (NYSE: FDX) provides customers and businesses worldwide with a broad 
portfolio of transportation, e-commerce and business services. With annual revenues of $48 
billion, the company offers integrated business applications through operating companies 
competing collectively and managed collaboratively, under the respected FedEx brand. 
Consistently ranked among the world's most admired and trusted employers, FedEx inspires 
its more than 325,000 team members to remain "absolutely, positively" focused on safety, the 
highest ethical and professional standards and the needs of their customers and 
communities. For more information, visit news.fedex.com. 

 
About FedEx Ground: 

FedEx Ground, a part of FedEx Corp. (NYSE: FDX), is a leader in cost-effective, small-
package ground shipping, offering dependable service to businesses and residential 
customers throughout the U.S. and Canada. FedEx Ground is faster to more locations than its 
primary competitor and includes FedEx Home Delivery for residential customers and FedEx 
SmartPost specializing in the delivery of low-weight packages from businesses to residential 
customers through a partnership with the U.S. Postal Service®. Through a network of more 
than 71,000 employees, 560 distribution hubs and local pickup-and-delivery stations, and 
42,000 motorized vehicles, FedEx Ground transports approximately 6.9 million packages 
daily. The company reported annual revenue of 13 billion in fiscal year 2015.  

 
FedEx Ground in the Pittsburgh Region:   

FedEx has more than 3,000 employees in the Pittsburgh region, about 2,400 of which are 
located in the FedEx Ground headquarters building in Robinson. 

FedEx Ground operates five facilities in the Pittsburgh region: 
 Headquarters – Moon Township 
 Neville Island  
 Sewickley  
 Greensburg  
 Clinton 

In addition, FedEx Ground is building a new 300,000 sq. ft. distribution center in Jackson 
Township expected to open in August 2016.  

In February 2015, FedEx acquired Pittsburgh-based GENCO, an industry leading third-party 
logistics provider that will significantly enhance the FedEx portfolio of transportation services. 

 
Community Support and Engagement: 

FedEx Ground is committed to the Pittsburgh community through the strategic investment of 
our people, resources and network. Our corporate resources include financial contributions, 
in-kind charitable shipping services and volunteer services by our team members in the 
region. 
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